
January 14, 2025

UPCOMING EVENTS
To see the upcoming events for the months of January and February, please click here.

 

MAINE SOUTH HAWK SQUAWK

News from the Principal's Office

DISTRICT 207'S BEST FOR JANUARY
The Maine Township High School District 207 Board of Education recently honored three
students in the area of academic achievement naming them “207’s Best” at a recent meeting.
Laith Tannous was selected as Maine South’s best for his strong commitment to learning and
academic excellence. Congratulations, Laith! 🎉

2025-2026 SCHOOL CALENDAR APPROVED 🗓️

Please click on this link to view the approved school calendar for the 2025-2026 school year.

News from Student Experiences

SOUTHWORDS EARNS TWO HONOR DISTINCTIONS
Maine South High School’s Southwords newspaper recently earned two honor distinctions from
two different press associations. Southwords is a student-run publication designed as a public
forum for student opinion and balanced reporting on topics relevant to the Maine South High
School community.

In its most recent newspaper critique, the National Scholastic Press Association (NSPA)
awarded Southwords its highest honor rating, the prestigious All-American award. In addition to
scoring the points required for a First Class rating, the publication also earned four marks of
distinction in the areas of Coverage, Content, Visuals and Presentation. The judges noted that
Southwords’ issues were “full of so much relevant, important and entertaining information,” and
that it was “clear that Southwords is doing a true service to the community.”

https://f8uwpd6ab.cc.rs6.net/tn.jsp?f=001NjEXyhJ0VV03_N7vFt7xHPez84cbNInIzBAZVI4mq7f7wSzp2bVHWGo3u7rQVkQHi18rtRgWO6tyN3X2uSQ2f4Tbp-QzyiOm4kAN7cC18WBB1zas0yyQg_IWhNA1kOBZG-KWuul0aw4Hb2jUFc98c62PpmX4dbN7OesEVesdwaNJQRaGjSZjvEiJtDFT284yIIOPnOzjocX-8W9PYS2hzfUq59QM6gYbNQX-tUfrDn_R4BB3nMxlbA==&c=p3feJ8U-7q4rISQgQ7nqOlUXY5zDbjXcs9RuUVSeBlNHeIlj5g7S8Q==&ch=jFFkqqjjHphU9M9kNclcECFh98JZUCrVVdGiTpMqCyGKzCh9acQZ8A==
https://maine207.org/wp-content/uploads/2024/12/202526final.pdf


Additionally, the Kettle Moraine Press Association (KEMPA), awarded Southwords the honor
rating of “All-Kempa,” as part of its 2024 KEMPA Critique. This is the highest honor rating given
to newspapers that are submitted for critique. The judge noted that Southwords “truly
understands the heartbeat of the school community,” and that the Southwords journalists
“leveled up from last year, which was already stellar journalism.” 

“This recognition from judges across the country reflects Maine South’s student journalists’ drive
to produce a dynamic, informative and entertaining publication that our community can be proud
of,” says Southwords Adviser Alexander Stathakis.

The Southwords staff currently includes Editors-in-Chief Thomas Hurley and Caitlin Vengazo;
News Editors Joseph Calderon, Charlotte Chapman and Samara Lefler; Commentary Editors
Eliza Goldwasser, Hayden Magad and Emery Yates; Features Editors Quinn Annis, Ava Jurek and
Margaret Sheehan; Entertainment Editors Sayde Feeley, Grace Halpert and Josie Hennes;
Sports Editors Audrey Becker, Kyra Demeros and Brianna Giustino; and Production Editors Lily
Giambarberee and Anatasisa Musyakevich. 

MSHS JUNIOR CLASS COUNCIL FUNDRAISER



JUINIOR PROM

Even though we are in the start of a new semester, please enjoy these school photos prior to
winter break! Fine Arts took the stage in the Commons, showcasing their incredible talents. We
had our Student of the Quarter breakfast, recognizing students for their hard work and success
throughout Quarter 2. Dr. Babakhani surprised everyone with a coffee cart, bringing a little extra
warmth to the school day. Students and staff got into the spirit with some fantastic outfits during
Spirit Week, and to top it off, puppies visited!

MOMENTS BEFORE BREAK!





Since November, current 9th, 10th, and 11th-grade students have been meeting with their
counselors individually to select courses for the 2025-2026 school year. Current 9th graders will
conntinue to meet with counselors up until January 23rd. Please note that the deadline to make
any changes to course requests for all grades is January 23rd. Parents can view their child's
course requests by logging into schoolinks via their parent portal. This link will walk you through
how to access your parent Schoolinks account.Students should contact their counselor directly to
communicate any adjustments before this date.

News from Student & Family Services

COURSE SELECTION DEADLINE: JANUARY 23RD

Last week, we hosted our Course Selection Night for Incoming Freshmen and their families. The
evening began with a student panel, where current Hawks shared valuable insights about life at
Maine South. Families and students then met with their counselors to hear about course options
for the next school year!

INCOMING FRESHMEN - COURSE SELECTION NIGHT

https://f8uwpd6ab.cc.rs6.net/tn.jsp?f=001NjEXyhJ0VV03_N7vFt7xHPez84cbNInIzBAZVI4mq7f7wSzp2bVHWJ1JBFXd5ZaenLlz_R_cOFtpze-ZGmTZMuJZXrmNDbbWrayQx5Uq8OJ1QiNxYxFpL1uClCzWG4vJqTLRP2ndh-j038fArwXCWu5oZRR-uRKE4hYkGh9EFAsCCQYazYwuqqWlNf60qRi3C3Gt7tcbUgtYwV9GZvj_XDbeZfHO6dRSkLlbfpPUT4tyaijep9S4Ww==&c=p3feJ8U-7q4rISQgQ7nqOlUXY5zDbjXcs9RuUVSeBlNHeIlj5g7S8Q==&ch=jFFkqqjjHphU9M9kNclcECFh98JZUCrVVdGiTpMqCyGKzCh9acQZ8A==


College & Career

CCRC ACADEMY BONUS SESSION: CLASS OF 2026 COLLEGE KICKOFF

To register, please click HERE.

https://f8uwpd6ab.cc.rs6.net/tn.jsp?f=001NjEXyhJ0VV03_N7vFt7xHPez84cbNInIzBAZVI4mq7f7wSzp2bVHWGo3u7rQVkQH4LwqWmyx2WC0K-JhwBObVK3gQkoKmvGIKLSL4kj0L8_EHtsiuhsxXY5_X5w4fu10H61JcMOg1XSv0NWJrXOptnOOIbvi-jM1VKRI4WQLb6KlOIDnl8D12NWliWJzd0C_XfN79eKA79p4vzoLEW3WMxtuAhw94lpCArE23qMtQw-mPQlb0AP1QXKR05tvJbzzQ3Rli0cuL5-gpuhblxcoRCXXGeD4p3CYGCDSIti_73YPlUoNlAqRhx6nURc0CKspObV32ZGpqQQc5q_oscQQijJJXH5_onrnsBfcIibYNT1KLA_2MfEmb3QprJvbZpxJ6Wk9cmWfSvk7hZ1sx5hXyfuPGlGkEmIPzTZN_-Gr05yXdV5sostPOrVR7AmC0FOYDlDeCyrN-7KQs3LkCso-jsnUJ_Sqf7jHbpoXkrUBtHQ236osjELsxatLUa8GW0ifTBsbjnJfWUm9q3PZ4Bxdq-Dtwk3eVwUF&c=p3feJ8U-7q4rISQgQ7nqOlUXY5zDbjXcs9RuUVSeBlNHeIlj5g7S8Q==&ch=jFFkqqjjHphU9M9kNclcECFh98JZUCrVVdGiTpMqCyGKzCh9acQZ8A==


ALL STATE MUSIC & THEATRE STUDENTS
Congratulations to our All-State Music Students and our All-State Theatre Production Students!
Our All-State Musicians will be performing in Peoria January 30 - February 1, 2025. Our All-
State Theatre students are performing January 6 - 11, 2025. Bravo to our state-level performers!

MAINE SOUTH PARENTS SCHOLARSHIP CLUB (MSPSC)

News from Fine Arts

Speech, Drama, & Broadcasting Boosters: Senior Scholarship Application 

The Speech, Drama, and Broadcasting Boosters are offering a scholarship for seniors
who have shown dedication and passion in these areas. To apply, please click here.

Parent Clubs & Organizations

https://f8uwpd6ab.cc.rs6.net/tn.jsp?f=001NjEXyhJ0VV03_N7vFt7xHPez84cbNInIzBAZVI4mq7f7wSzp2bVHWGo3u7rQVkQHYYvt_Pq8PQTkSQUSqB-ksK-WviYoVib3rCHbWfpipLQkckZeaxDBIaUaZAXNTFjirRHioUmx314hcZnooaLdjyjLLsw8bNbDbV3oofIqKpC8GbXSc1EzwuUDsNIS0k9tWmMuQhEvhluatfNG3WbPysPWN_3Hd4btRWrSw3HRkX5fClfioUrnO01mxtG5Oz02m4O1y0EhKX0=&c=p3feJ8U-7q4rISQgQ7nqOlUXY5zDbjXcs9RuUVSeBlNHeIlj5g7S8Q==&ch=jFFkqqjjHphU9M9kNclcECFh98JZUCrVVdGiTpMqCyGKzCh9acQZ8A==


Team Fundraisers & Groups

COLOR GUARD

QUICK LINKS

Athletics Maine South Promise Maine South Online Store Parent Engagement

Bookstore Departments College & Career Student & Family Services

https://schools.snap.app/mainesouth
https://south.maine207.org/news/maine-south-promise-2/
https://sideline.bsnsports.com/schools/illinois/parkridge/maine-south-high-school
https://south.maine207.org/parents/
https://south.maine207.org/resources_and_programs/bookstore/
https://south.maine207.org/departments/
https://south.maine207.org/career-and-college-resource-center/
https://south.maine207.org/academics/student-services/

